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Editorial Review

Review
Everyone assumes it's easy for kids to make friends. But the truth is, it's just as hard for them to get to know
others as it is for adults. Now there's a new book that changes all that -- How Kids Make Friends: Secrets For
Making Lots Of Friends, No Matter How Shy You Are, written by Lonnie Michelle and illustrated by Teresa
McHugh. It's the kids' counterpart to Dale Carnegie's How To Make Friends And Influence People. How
Kids Make Friends is unique because it not only speaks to children, but to adults as well. Through dozens of
sometimes-whimsical, colorful illustrations and friendly text, Michelle, a leading authority on child behavior,
makes friendship-making easy and helps youngsters gain new self-confidence. How Kids Make Friends
encourages children to believe in themselves. First, it helps kids realize they are important, likeable, and
deserve good friendships. Youngsters will learn how to make all the friends they want easily, how popular
kids get that way, what to talk about even if you can't think of anything to say, how to get someone's
attention without saying a word, and how to get rid of shyness -- forever. Parents and teachers are treated to a
special chapter in Michelle's book. They discover how to interact with their child in dozens of positive,
affirming ways. They will see the value of helping their children learn these important social skills at an
early age. Michelle shows parents ways to gain the respect of their children--without even having to ask for
it--and techniques to reinforce the success habits children learn early on. "How Kids Make Friends" also
gives parents pointers to make their child feel more comfortable inviting friends over, what to do when they
arrive, and most of all, how to enjoy the friendships their kids are making to the fullest. "Learning these
habits at an early age is one of the best things that could happen to your child," Michelle writes. She has
studied child behavior and interaction for fifteen years, and presents interactive seminars. As a mother of
two, she speaks from a wealth of experience. How Kids Make Friends is highly recommended for children
ages six and up, parents, grandparents, educators and libraries. -- Midwest Book Review

Friends make life full and exciting; children's needs are vast and with the addition of each new friend lies a
piece of the child's puzzle for completeness. Conversely, having few or no friends limits a child's personality
and may lead to a poor self-concept and possibly to crippling emotional problems. In this book, the author
acts like the kind and caring aunt who provides unconditional positive love and offers valuable secrets that
can make life fulfilling and full of promise. She has created a gem of a book, both for children and parents.
Each page offers the child a new tip and new possibilities. With each new strategy comes greater confidence
and opening up to rewarding experiences. This book should be required reading for all elementary and
middle school-aged children. -- Gerald D. Oster, Ph.D., Clinical Associate Professor of Psychiatry,
University of Maryland Medical School. Co-author, Helping Your Depressed Teenager: A guide for parents
and caregivers

How Kids Make Friends is highly recommended for children ages six and up, parents, grandparents,
educators and libraries. -- The Midwest Book Review

I LOVED this book! By the time my mom and I were finished reading it, my face hurt from smiling so
much. -- Julie R, age 9

I wish How Kids Make Friends had been available to me 30 years ago. It sure would have made my life
easier. -- Shel Horowitz, author, The Penny-Pinching Hedonist: How to Live Like Royalty with a Peasant's
Pocketbook



Lonnie Michelle has written what could be your child's first self-help book - How Kids Make
Friends...Secrets for making lots of friends, no matter how shy you are. It definitely, yet gently, shows kids
in their own language that acquiring friendships is a matter of the choices you make and the responsibility
you take for the task - not something beyond their reach. This is a valuable lesson which if generalized can
extend to many other life skills as well. I highly recommend it. -- Michael S. Broder, Ph.D., author of The
Art of Living Single

Lonnie Michelle takes a sensitive subject and makes it a comfortable one; for both parent and child. With a
new house, new neighborhood and new school ahead of us, this was just the book our family needed to jump
that social hurdle and make new friends. -- Lisa Roberts, author of How to Raise a Family and A Career
Under One Roof

Lonnie Michelle's book comes at a good time for an audience of parents, teachers, therapists and others who
enjoy helping children grow and make their way in this complex society...It is written in a relaxed and upbeat
manner with lots of specific suggestions and strategies that children can adopt for meeting new people,
learning what to say, and what to do. Ms. Michelle doesn't just give advise: she has many explanations for
why she suggests youngsters do as she says... -- Rita P. Sussman, Ph.D. Clinical Psychologist

WOW yourself by effortlessly raising your self esteem now. Read this book. -- New York Times best-selling
author Mark Victor Hansen, Chicken Soup for The Soul

Where was your book ten years ago when I needed it? You've managed to fill an empty slot on the bookstore
shelf, and I hope it does well. Useful information. A book every parent needs. -- Paula Hrbacek newspaper
columnist, "Paula's Projects"

From the Publisher
This darling book has been especially popular for children who are shy or have recently moved to a new
school, parents and grandparents, educators, librarians, child therapists, and special education schools and
educators. How Kids Make Friends is available in bulk and charitable fundraising by special order. Give
your child the gift of friendship.

From the Author
Our pre-teen kids were moving for the first time in their lives, and they were concerned about making friends
at their new school. Although our family hadn't moved in over ten years, my husband and I moved a
combined nine times by the time we were in high school. While speaking to one of our children about
making new friends, we realized that there are no classes in school that teach one of the most important
social skills every child (and adult) should have - how to make friends.

With our sincere desire to help our children make their transition as easy as possible, and by combining our
experience with substantial research, we have been led to write this practical and enjoyable book on making
friends. We consulted with our children, as well as some of their friends and cousins from the beginning to
make sure that kids their own age will enjoy reading it, and will respond to the easy and entertaining ways
we present its message. We thank them very much for their help.

Users Review

From reader reviews:



Myra Lopez:

Book is to be different for each grade. Book for children till adult are different content. As you may know
that book is very important for all of us. The book How Kids Make Friends: Secrets for Making Lots of
Friends No Matter How Shy You Are ended up being making you to know about other know-how and of
course you can take more information. It is quite advantages for you. The e-book How Kids Make Friends:
Secrets for Making Lots of Friends No Matter How Shy You Are is not only giving you a lot more new
information but also to get your friend when you really feel bored. You can spend your personal spend time
to read your guide. Try to make relationship using the book How Kids Make Friends: Secrets for Making
Lots of Friends No Matter How Shy You Are. You never really feel lose out for everything in case you read
some books.

Sylvia Healey:

In this 21st hundred years, people become competitive in each way. By being competitive today, people have
do something to make all of them survives, being in the middle of often the crowded place and notice by
simply surrounding. One thing that sometimes many people have underestimated that for a while is reading.
That's why, by reading a publication your ability to survive enhance then having chance to stand than other is
high. In your case who want to start reading some sort of book, we give you that How Kids Make Friends:
Secrets for Making Lots of Friends No Matter How Shy You Are book as starter and daily reading guide.
Why, because this book is more than just a book.

Chris Henderson:

This How Kids Make Friends: Secrets for Making Lots of Friends No Matter How Shy You Are tend to be
reliable for you who want to be a successful person, why. The key reason why of this How Kids Make
Friends: Secrets for Making Lots of Friends No Matter How Shy You Are can be on the list of great books
you must have is usually giving you more than just simple reading food but feed an individual with
information that might be will shock your earlier knowledge. This book is usually handy, you can bring it
everywhere you go and whenever your conditions in the e-book and printed people. Beside that this How
Kids Make Friends: Secrets for Making Lots of Friends No Matter How Shy You Are forcing you to have an
enormous of experience including rich vocabulary, giving you trial of critical thinking that we realize it
useful in your day pastime. So , let's have it and revel in reading.

James Martin:

As a pupil exactly feel bored in order to reading. If their teacher inquired them to go to the library as well as
to make summary for some guide, they are complained. Just small students that has reading's soul or real
their interest. They just do what the instructor want, like asked to go to the library. They go to there but
nothing reading significantly. Any students feel that looking at is not important, boring and can't see colorful
pics on there. Yeah, it is being complicated. Book is very important for you personally. As we know that on
this period, many ways to get whatever we really wish for. Likewise word says, ways to reach Chinese's
country. Therefore , this How Kids Make Friends: Secrets for Making Lots of Friends No Matter How Shy
You Are can make you really feel more interested to read.
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