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Editorial Review

Review
Pre-Unit: Welcome to Our Class 1. Talking with Others 2. Let's Go Shopping! 3. Food 4. Housing 5. Our
Community 6. Health and Fitness 7. Working on It 8. People and Learning

About the Author
Rob Jenkins is a professor of ESL and the Faculty Development Coordinator serving over 300 instructors
teaching for Santa Ana College School of Continuing Education in California. He is a recipient of the Santa
Ana College Distinguished Faculty Award. Rob is also a textbook author and consultant for National
Geographic Learning. He is the author of Stand Out and series editor for World English, and also consults on
state and national projects. Rob and Staci Johnson, his co-author, were awarded the Heinle Outstanding
Achievement Award for their contribution to publishing in 2013

Ever since I can remember, I've been fascinated with other cultures and languages. I love to travel and every
place I go, the first thing I want to do is meet the people, learn their language, and understand their culture.
Becoming an ESL teacher was a perfect way to turn what I love to do into my profession. There's nothing
more incredible than the exchange of teaching and learning from one another that goes on in an ESL
classroom. And there's nothing more rewarding than helping a student succeed.

Users Review

From reader reviews:

Bobby Miller:

Reading a book can be one of a lot of action that everyone in the world adores. Do you like reading book
thus. There are a lot of reasons why people fantastic. First reading a reserve will give you a lot of new
information. When you read a e-book you will get new information because book is one of various ways to
share the information or maybe their idea. Second, studying a book will make you actually more imaginative.
When you reading through a book especially tale fantasy book the author will bring you to imagine the story
how the people do it anything. Third, it is possible to share your knowledge to other individuals. When you
read this Stand Out 1: Standards-Based English (Stand Out: Standards-Based English), you are able to tells
your family, friends and soon about yours book. Your knowledge can inspire average, make them reading a
reserve.

Hae Hughes:

With this era which is the greater man or woman or who has ability in doing something more are more
treasured than other. Do you want to become considered one of it? It is just simple way to have that. What
you have to do is just spending your time almost no but quite enough to possess a look at some books. On the
list of books in the top checklist in your reading list is Stand Out 1: Standards-Based English (Stand Out:
Standards-Based English). This book which is qualified as The Hungry Mountains can get you closer in
getting precious person. By looking upward and review this e-book you can get many advantages.



Barbara Kimmel:

What is your hobby? Have you heard which question when you got students? We believe that that question
was given by teacher to the students. Many kinds of hobby, All people has different hobby. Therefore you
know that little person similar to reading or as reading become their hobby. You should know that reading is
very important as well as book as to be the factor. Book is important thing to provide you knowledge, except
your personal teacher or lecturer. You see good news or update in relation to something by book. Numerous
books that can you choose to use be your object. One of them is Stand Out 1: Standards-Based English
(Stand Out: Standards-Based English).

Lewis Skinner:

Many people said that they feel fed up when they reading a book. They are directly felt the item when they
get a half parts of the book. You can choose the book Stand Out 1: Standards-Based English (Stand Out:
Standards-Based English) to make your personal reading is interesting. Your own personal skill of reading
talent is developing when you like reading. Try to choose very simple book to make you enjoy to study it and
mingle the opinion about book and reading through especially. It is to be 1st opinion for you to like to open
up a book and study it. Beside that the publication Stand Out 1: Standards-Based English (Stand Out:
Standards-Based English) can to be your brand-new friend when you're feel alone and confuse with what
must you're doing of this time.
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